
Introduction

The lack of gold-standard randomised controlled
trial (RCT) evidence to support clinical decision-
making in acute cardiovascular care represents an
area of particular unmet need, where significant
variation in practice and underuse or overuse of
clinical treatments can occur (1,2). Most
recommendations are based on observational
analyses rather than
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One immediate reflection when examining Table 2



5

In a recent priority setting paper for advanced heart
failure set by the James Lind Alliance (22), one
particular statement stood out from the patient
perspective: ‘what helps with symptoms from
peripheral oedema experienced by people with
advanced heart failure? For example, massage,
exercise?’.

Conclusion

Whilst there remain gaps in the evidence base for
treating fluid overload seen with decompensated
heart failure, an unplanned admission to hospital is
nevertheless a sentinel event for patients who stay
on average at least 7 days in NHS hospitals. In this
time, there are opportunities to improve patient care
alongside uncertainties about the best way in doing
so. Perhaps the most important known unknown for
managing acute heart failure is to collect patient
views more rigorously and to tailor broad
recommendations from professional guidance into
distinct, shared solutions for every HF patient that is
treated.
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